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Spa Services
Skin Care

A Facial is a vital step towards beautiful skin, which can also treat various skin conditions such as
discoloration and acne, and restoring and revitalizing the skin with staggering results.

We specialize in an array of facials suitable for your skin type or particular problem.

Services Description Reg VIP
Deluxe
Facial

Cleansing, exfoliation, extractions and an individualized special treatment masque
with lots of massage and pampering. A good choice for beginners. 60 50

Deep Pore
Cleansing
Facial

As a Basic Facial, but includes extra time for extractions and masque. Ideal for
congested skin. 65 55

Gentleman’s
Facial

Designed for the special skincare of a man. Cleansing, exfoliation, extractions and
an individualized special treatment which relieves razor burns, skin dryness and
irritation. Please shave at least 24 hours prior to your appointment.

65 55

T-zone
Facial

A half-hour exfoliation and extraction to rid that ever-oily T-Zone of its inevitable
oil area. Not blissful but beneficial. Great for those who ‘clog-up’ between
facials.

55 45

Fully
Loaded
Facial

This revitalizing treatment, for skin that needs extra attention, begins with a deep
cleansing followed by a gentle enzyme Bio Peel, massage, extractions (removal of
blackheads), specialized serums/boosters, masque, hands and feet massage. Too
good for mere words!

80 70

Glycolic
Facial

As a Basic Facial, but includes Glycolic Treatment. Using a 35% Glycolic Acid,
this extensive peel, used as well in dermatologists’ offices, helps smooth out the
appearance of fine lines and wrinkles, eliminates ‘age spots’ and signs of sun
damage. It also decongests clogged, oily, acne prone skin. (For maximum results,
we recommend a series of six sessions at a special price of $450

75 65

Multi-
Vitamin
Power
Facial

As a Basic Facial, but includes Multi-Vitamin treatment. Designed to treat
environmentally-damaged skin, this treatment includes a non-irritating vitamin
power exfoliation and a vitamin recovery masque to noticeably improve skin
elasticity, tone and texture.

75 65

Alpha-
Hydroxy
Acid Facial

As a Basic Facial, but includes Alpha-Hydroxy Acid treatment. It is designed as
an exfoliation system, that is non-abrasive and active enough even for resistant
skins.

70 60

Adolescent
Facial

A learning experience for teens. Treatment is tailored to address specific skin
issues, identifies and treats future problems. Ideal for clogged, oily and acne
prone skin.

55 45


